

BID TABULATIONS

CITY OF WESTLAKE, OHIO

Name: **2020 Stone, Sand, Dirt & Gravel**

Date: **Wednesday, February 26, 2020**

Bidder			Bidder # 1	Bidder # 2	Bidder # 3	Bidder # 4	Bidder # 5
			The Arms Trucking Co. 14818 Mayfield Rd./P.O. Box 369 E. Claridon, Ohio 44033 800-362-1343	Erie Materials, Inc. 4507 Tiffin Ave. Sandusky, Ohio 44870 419-625-7374	Redland Quarries NY Inc, DBA Lafarge Great Lakes 2106 West 3rd St. Cleveland, Ohio 44113 216-242-0593	Shelly Materials, Inc. 8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. Suite 120 Twinsburg, Ohio 44087 330-405-7451	P&P Valley View Holdings DBA Boyas Excavating 4830 Warner Rd. Garfield Hts., Ohio 44125 216-524-3620
Bid Bond / Certified Check			Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond	Bid Bond
Item #	Description	Qty./Unit					
Stone & Gravel							
A1	#1 / #2 Stone	Ton	No Bid	\$20.00	\$19.75	\$22.95	No Bid
A2	#4 Stone	Ton	No Bid	\$21.75	No Bid	\$22.95	No Bid
A3	#8 – Stone	Ton	No Bid	\$21.00	\$20.10	\$24.50	No Bid
A4	#10 Screening	Ton	No Bid	\$20.00	No Bid	\$20.40	No Bid
A5	#57 Stone	Ton	No Bid	\$21.50	\$20.50	\$23.50	No Bid
A6	#304 Stone	Ton	No Bid	\$16.00	\$16.00	\$17.45	No Bid
A7	#411 Screening	Ton	No Bid	\$16.50	No Bid	\$18.95	No Bid
Sand							
B1	Sand – Fill	Ton	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.75	\$14.50
B2	Sand – Masonry	Ton	\$22.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.15	No Bid
B3	Volleyball Court Sand	Ton	\$47.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B4	Sand – Trap/Bunker	Ton	\$56.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B5	Top Dressing Sand	Ton	\$37.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B6	Tee Mix	Ton	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dirt & Topsoil							
C1	Ball Diamond Mix	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.50
C2	Natural Red Vitrified Ball Diamond Clay	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid